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(A gallery of many image/photo quotes are at the end of the article. This article did get pretty long, but it is
packed full of information from many different sources: quotes, excerpts, videos – and I recommend the gallery
at the end)

Introduction:
I feel it is extremely important to have a page on this website dedicated to information about Zionism. From my
research I can only conclude that the vast majority of the world’s problems can be traced back to International Jewry.
The Jewish Zionists (International Jewry) are behind the slave system we find ourselves in on this planet. Some call
these Jewish Supremacist Zionists ‘Ashkenazi Jews’ or  ‘Fake Jews’ or ‘Khazar Jews’ or ‘Khazarian Mafia’ – but those
names are a deflection or distraction. I don’t use the word ‘jew’ too often as this can be emotive (triggering) for
people… as I know how brainwashed people are… it is however pretty accurate to say that it is the ‘elite’ Jewish
supremacists (International Jewry) and Zionists that are causing the majority of the problems in the world… (see the
two Red Pilling introductory videos below, which will explain some of this. Much programming has been done to
attempt to get people to not criticize jewish people, they can do this as they own pretty much all the media. Anyway, if
you read through the great deal of information on this page you will see.)

It is important to recognize that International Jewry have written and published most of our history books (If your book
does not fit into their story and rhetoric then it will be hard to get it published), that Jewry pretty much own all the
media – they own Hollywood, nearly all the Banks, the Television Networks, the Large Corporations, the Music
Industry, they own Google, Facebook, YouTube, Amazon etc etc – and have agents infiltrated into the alternative media,
ufology and spiritual groups. 

I would like to point out that I am a seeker of truth,  and not affiliated to a religion. You should see from the content of
this website that I am a man motivated by Love, Truth and Justice. I put this article together for these reasons, and
because I don’t want to see humanity get continually oppressed, manipulated and engulfed by this New World Order
agenda.

This article will also have some information and links related to how Hitler and National Socialism have been
misrepresented – both were a huge threat to International Jewry’s plan for their ‘New World Order’. There is a great
deal of evidence that very clearly shows that Hitler was fighting against the Jewish Freemasonic Zionist Bankers – the
allied forces were all controlled by International Jewry, and they brought war against Hitler and Germany, so as to
destroy them completely. Hitler tried many times for peace. 

It is hard for many to believe some of these things – the amount of propaganda International Jewry have put out
regarding Hitler, the Second World War and Germany is astonishing – but we have been told so many lies about it. The
most shocking thing that I have come across related to this subject is the Holocaust Hoax – there is no real evidence that
gas chambers were used and that any Jews were gassed at all – plenty of evidence to suggest that no gassing occurred. I
would suggest you research and listen to Ernst Zundel, David Cole, Nick Kollerstrom, Dennis Wise and Fred Leuchter
to start with, when researching the Holocaust – and there is a link to an excellent Holocaust article later in this article. 

And remember The National Socialist German Workers’ Party did not call themselves ‘Nazis’ or refer to ‘Nazism’ –
these terms are part of the Zionists anti-Hitler and anti-Germany propaganda. Again – it’s The National Socialist
German Workers’ Party, not the ‘Nazis’. This article will explain it for you:

https://justice4germans.wordpress.com/2013/04/16/exposing-the-nazi-epithet-who-started-it-why-how-and-who-
benefits/

People should also remember that Jewish Zionists were of course the architects of the 9/11 false flag attack – the
evidence, of course, leads to Israel and Mossad being behind it.

Essentially these Zionists (which of course includes Donald Trump – an obvious Zionist Puppet: look at all the Zionists
he has surrounded himself with politically, look how he has continued with the fake terrorist attacks in America, look at
his families links and background – and also what he has said about Israel) are trying to set up this New World Order.
They want to totally destabilize the Middle East, (The Greater Israel Project) expand and eventually rule the world from
there – from Jerusalem. International Jewry and the Zionists constantly seek more and more control over the general
public, or the ‘Goyim’, ‘Goy’ or ‘Gentiles’- words they use to refer to the rest of humanity, or the ‘non-Jews’.

These Freemasonic Jewish Zionists running things are also behind all the fake and fabricated terrorism we see occurring
in the world… the fake shootings in America and the fake Islamic terrorism in Europe – Article link:

False Flags – Fake Shootings – Fake Terrorism – Psyops, Hoaxes – Illuminati, Freemasons, Zionists

In this article I will share lots of quotes from a variety of sources and I am going to provide excerpts from some articles,
with some links below them – so that you can then read the full article from which the text was taken from. I will also
provide some relevant videos on this subject. There will also be a gallery of many jpeg photo quotes at the end. The
article will provide some important information, but its main aim is to sow some seeds and inspire you to do further
research. But be aware that the Zionists / Jewry have a great deal of controlled opposition agents, (hasbara) all over the
internet and alternative media, and they are incredibly manipulative – and they will try to debunk many of these quotes.

“And we in the real Truth movement are aware that we are not up against a NWO, or the Illuminati, but a Jew World
Order. With International Jewry pulling all the strings.” – https://diggerfortruth.wordpress.com/2014/04/18/putin-just-
another-oligarch-jew/

“The meaning of the history of the last century is that today 300 Jewish financiers, all Masters of (Masonic) Lodges,
rule the world.” – Jean Izoulet, prominent member of Jewish Alliance Israelite Universelle, 1931

“At the head of all those secret societies, which form provisional governments, men of the Jewish race are to be found.”
– Benjamin Disraeli, Jewish, Prime Minister of England

A couple of introductory videos on this subject ( I have to keep
finding new videos, as (((YouTube))) keeps censoring and deleting:

Introductory Quotes:

“It is a marvel that the American people do not rise up and drive every JEW out of this country…. We Jews have put
issue upon issue to the American people. Then we promote both sides of the issue as confusion reigns. With their eye’s
fixed on the issues, they fail to see who is behind every scene. We Jews toy with the American public as a cat toys with
a mouse….  We control every media of expression including newspapers, magazines, radio and television. Even your
music! We censor the songs released for publication long before they reach the publishers. Before long we will have
complete control of your thinking.” –  The Harold Wallace Rosenthal Interview 1976, The Hidden Tyranny 

“The role of the president of the United States is to support the decisions that are made by the people of Israel. It is not
up to us to pick and choose from among the political parties.” – Ann Lewis, Senior Advisor to Hillary Clinton

“Every time we do something you tell me Americans will do this and will do that. I want to tell you something very
clear, don’t worry about American pressure on Israel. We, the Jewish people, control America, and the Americans know
it.” – Ariel Sharon, Former Israeli Prime Minister

“The Jews of the world, the Zionists and their co-religionists everywhere, are determined that they are going to again
use the United States to help them permanently retain Palestine as their foothold for their world government. That is
just as true as I am standing here. Not alone have I read it, but many here have also read it, and it is known all over the
world.”– Benjamin Freedman – http://www.biblebelievers.org.au/benjamin.htm

“Zionism is Judaism, and Judaism is unthinkable without Zionism.”  – Harper’s Encyclopedia of United States
History, Vol. X, “Zionists”

“The Bolshevik Revolution in Russia was the work of Jewish planning and Jewish dissatisfaction. Our Plan is to have a
New World Order. What worked so wonderfully in Russia, is going to become Reality for the whole world.” – (The
American Hebrew Magazine, New York, Sep. 10, 1920)

“All property of other nations belongs to the Jewish nation, which consequently is entitled to seize upon it without any
scruples.” – The Talmud, a central text of mainstream Judaism.

“First of all, we have to understand what communism is…..real communism, the Soviet communism, is basically a
mask for Bolshevism, which is a mask for Judaism.” – Bobby Fischer, a Jew, press Conference, September 1 1992 –
 http://lovkap.blogspot.co.uk/2013/05/freemasonry-zionism-communism.html

“The governments of the peoples included in this world republic, with the aid of the victorious proletariat, all will fall
without difficulty into Jewish hands. Private property will then be strangled by the Jewish directors, who will
administer the state patrimony everywhere. Thus the promise of the Talmud will be fulfilled, that is, the promise that the
Jews, at the arrival of the Messiah, will possess the key to the wealth of all the peoples of the earth.” – Baruch Levy, in
a letter to Karl Marx, published in the Rothschild controlled La Revue de Paris, June 1, 1928

The Curse of Usury

We want to transform this planet – we want abundance, a good life for all and the end of poverty – we want fairness and
justice – we want to restore the natural world – we want to work less – we want the end of debt slavery – we want
creativity and beauty – we want to spend more time with our families. We want to stop the New World Order Agenda.
Then we must end usury. All countries must end usury. All people need to understand the curse of usury.

“You have got to have trust, and I am saying that this is the problem with Jewish involvement in finance – they are
taught not to trust the ‘Goyim’, they are taught to exploit the ‘Goyim’ – this is what they learn from the Talmud.
Eventually, through usury, they take control and there is no trust in the society, and the society breaks down. And that’s
where we stand now.”– E Michael Jones – Goy Guide To World History

“Usury concentrates wealth into fewer and fewer hands. And so for a group like the Jews, that is always a small
minority, will be interested in strategies that will concentrate wealth. They’ve also had centuries of experience in
dealing with it, from small time stuff, to big time stuff. So they would naturally gravitate towards this, they have
become experts in using these covert means of taking over the culture. Using finance in a predatory way, that is covert –
and so most people don’t see them as being involved” – E Michael Jones – Goy Guide To World History

“Usury is the original sin in the economic sphere and the root cause of all our economic problems. It causes
unfathomable suffering. It is so pervasive, so normalized, it seems unavoidable. The truth is we have everything we
need to create an interest-free money supply and eradicate usury and associated rent-seeking completely from our
economic and social lives. A Usury-Free economy ends poverty and brings abundance to the many. It will save our
souls in the process.” – http://usuryfree.blogspot.co.uk/2013/05/babylon-usury-we-want-interest-free.html

“The cultures of ancient Greece and Rome likewise denounced usury. Aristotle called it the most unnatural and unjust
of all trades. Money, he said, was to be used for exchange, not the breeding of money from money. Plato condemned it
on the grounds that it set one class against another and was therefore destructive to the state. In Rome Cicero, Cato and
Seneca made similar censures.” – http://usuryfree.blogspot.co.uk/2013/04/usury-root-of-all-evil.html

“Usury is the elite Jews most powerful and demonic weapon amongst their whole armament of destructive weapons.
More powerful than their poisons and even their mind control techniques. Because it’s their use of compound interest
that enables them to create a stranglehold on every industry and therefore every level of society.” –
 https://thegreateststorynevertold.tv/10-reasons-why-hitler-was-one-of-the-good-guys/

“Capitalism, according to Heinrich Pesch, is state sponsored usury. And it’s the appropriation, the systematic
appropriation, of all surplus value – so the first reform would be to eliminate usury, and that would be the
alternative.”  – E Michael Jones – Goy Guide To World History

(There were some quotes there by E. Michael Jones. But I am not a fan. He promotes the subversive and pacifying
Christianity and all the ‘Logos’ subversion. It is becoming clear he is some type of Controlled Opposition Shill and
actually says there is no such thing as the White race or White people. Perhaps he is just blinded by his obsession with
Catholicism.)

Satanism – Freemasonry – Zionism – Kabbalah
“The Khazarian king was given a choice between Islam, Christianity and Judaism. The Khazarian king chose Judaism,
and promised to stay within the requirements laid out by the surrounding confederacy of nations led by the Russian
czar. Despite his agreement and promise, the Khazarian king and his inner circle of oligarchs kept practicing ancient
Babylonian black-magic, also known as Secret Satanism. This Secret Satanism involved occult ceremonies featuring
child sacrifice, after “bleeding them out”, drinking their blood and eating their hearts.

The deep dark secret of the occult ceremonies was that they were all based on ancient Baal Worship, also known as
worship of the Owl. In order to fool the confederacy of nations led by Russia that were watching Khazaria, the
Khazarian king melded these Luciferian black-magick practices with Judaism and created a secret Satanic-hybrid
religion, known as Babylonian Talmudism. This was made the national religion of Khazaria, and nurtured the same evil
that Khazaria was known for before.

Sadly, the Khazarians continued their evil ways, robbing and murdering those from surrounding countries who traveled
through Khazaria. Khazarian robbers often attempted to assume their identities after they murdered these visitors, and
became masters of disguises and false identities — a practice they have continued even to this very day, along with their
child-sacrifice occult ceremonies, which are actually ancient Baal Worship.”

– Preston James and Mike Harris – http://www.veteranstoday.com/2015/03/08/the-hidden-history-of-the-incredibly-
evil-khazarian-mafia/

(Veterans Today are Controlled Opposition. And I am not sure about the whole ‘Most, or all, the bad Jews are
Khazars’ rhetoric or just the Khazar rhetoric in general – I think it might be dis-info or at the very least an
exaggeration of sorts. Jews have been causing problems throughout history… for a long time – They have been
expelled from countries at least 109 times! And they were not war like, in that they are not known to be warriors
–  but rather they are historically notorious for their parasitism, usury, manipulations from behind the scenes to
create the wars, and some other very unpleasant activities. International Jewry, and jews in general, have been
causing problems for many, many centuries. I think they are trying to distract from the fact that all these dark
satanic practices go back a lot longer than the Khazars… there is also a much longer history of ritual sacrifice…
these holy books such as the Talmud – which say terrible things about non-jews – are a lot older… I think the
Khazar rhetoric is a deflection and distraction)

A link to an Article about some of the falseness in the Khazar Theory:

http://www.renegadetribune.com/debunked-bunkum-dr-duke-dr-macdonald-agree-khazar-theory-untenable/

“’Kabbalah’ is the unacknowledged religion of the West, a fact that will become evident over time. It is the belief
system of Freemasonry and organized Jewry, the two forces that govern the world. It is the reason God and the Ten
Commandments have been banished from public life, why Christianity has been gutted and replaced by moral
relativity….

The Kabbalah is a hoax, but one which governs our deluded and degenerate society.

For the Kabbalist, good and evil are ‘relative’ so evil is an illusion. Instead of right and wrong, Kabbalah says every
action is like the moon, with a light side and dark side. The Kabbalists say that the adept must embrace his or her dark
side to become, “a fully integrated human being”.

Not everyone who studies Kabbalah becomes a Satanist. But, Kabbalah is a prerequisite for ALL Luciferian
practitioners. Freemasonry rides on Kabbalah, the 19th century “Pope of Freemasonry” Albert Pike said, [6]

“The masonic Religion should be, by all of us initiates of the higher degrees, maintained in the Purity of the Luciferian
doctrine. If Lucifer were not God, would Adonay and his priests calumniate him?

Yes, Lucifer is God, and unfortunately Adonay is also god. For the eternal law is that there is no light without shade, no
beauty without ugliness, no white without black, for the absolute can only exist as two gods…”[7]

There is only one God. Lucifer is the spine-chilling vacuum that results from the absence of God. The Kabbalah is a
hoax that allows its followers to reformulate reality to serve their selfish interests. This is why they teach that “truth is
by its nature subjective.”

Modernism and secularism are based on the Kabbalah. It is the reason our “civilization” is preoccupied with violence,
sex and the occult, and why current events appeared to be scripted in Hollywood. It is the reason our political and
cultural leaders are liars and why society has lost its bearings.

As long as Kabbalists (i.e. Illuminati) continue to rule, humanity will continue to spin its wheels.” – Richard Evans –
https://www.henrymakow.com/whats_wrong_with_the_kabbalah.html

(Although this above extract comes form Henry Makow’s website I am not a fan of him – he is Controlled Opposition –
he puts a lot of disinfo out about Adolf Hitler.)

“History proves, and the Jewish Encyclopaedia confirms it, that the so-called “German, Russian, Polish and Eastern
Jews” are Mongols, who accepted the Jewish Talmud, which is not the creed given to Moses. The Talmud seems more
like the by-laws of a gang of murderers than a religion, yet it is strictly followed by so-called “Jews.”” – Maj. Gen.
Count Cherep-Spiriodich

“Most Jews do not like to admit it, but our god is Lucifer…and we are his chosen people…” – Harold Wallace
Rosenthal  – a Jewish whistleblower

“Judaism is just another religion? A good trick this one. Often we can see in places such as schools, colleges, or
libraries a poster on the wall with all the different religions of the world – inclusive of Judaism. Arhhh how sweet. Just
another innocuous religion, serving humanity for good…  When this couldn’t be further from the Truth. Judaism is a
destructive cult. It is made up of tribe members who have diverted from serving humanity for the betterment of society
and goodness of the planet. It is a self-serving ideology of hate for humanity and destruction of the the world. It is a
demonically driven destructive force.” – https://diggerfortruth.wordpress.com/2013/01/24/10-sure-pointers-to-define-
the-difference-between-truthers-and-half-truthers/

Freemasonry – Solomon’s Temple:

“Freemasonry is Jewish secret society which aspires for Jewish World Domination;”

http://lovkap.blogspot.co.uk/p/masonic-index.html

“Freemasonry is a Jewish establishment, whose history, grades, official appointments, passwords, and explanations are
Jewish from beginning to end.” – Rabbi Isaac Wise

“Freemasonry is born out of Israel.” – The Jewish Guardian, 12 April 1922

“The most important duty of freemasonry must be to glorify the Jews, which has preserved the unchanged divine
standard of wisdom.” – French masonic magazine Le Symbolisme July 1928

“Masonry is based on Judaism. Eliminate the teachings of Judaism from the Masonic ritual and what is left?” – The
Jewish Tribune, 1927

“The Grand Lodge Masonry of the present day is wholly Jewish.” – Richard Carlile, The Manual of Freemasonry

“Communism and Freemasonry refers to the relationship between the movements of freemasonry and communism, the
former having influenced the latter. Both movements couch their propaganda in the terms of “progress”, “humanity”,
“equality” and “universal brotherhood”. A common perception of both movements from critics is that they are tools of
international Jewry. Generally freemasonry acts to weaken the nation through liberalism and decadence to the point that
it cannot resist a takeover by the more openly and explicitly despotic communists. This happened during the so-called
“Russian Revolution”…”

http://lovkap.blogspot.co.uk/2013/05/freemasonry-zionism-communism.html

“Freemasonry, a type of secret society founded on the esoteric principles of Kabbalistic Judaism, evolved out of the
system of trade-guilds that had existed in Europe for centuries. While there were actual guilds for real stone-cutters and
masons, Freemasonry had little to do with actual stone-cutting or mason-work. Instead, the Jews who organized the
fraternity known as Freemasonry adopted the symbolism of stone-masons as a subtle hint at their true purpose –
rebuilding the Temple in Jerusalem, in other words Zionism…. they hope to eventually rebuild their Temple as King
Solomon had originally built it, and rule the world as “God’s chosen people” – an aristocracy of Jews ruling over
gentile peasant serfs.”

http://wethoughttheywerewhite.weebly.com:80/who-are-the-jews.html

“What is strange and worrying about this phenomenon [rebuilding the temple of Solomon in Jerusalem] is not just the
fact that these people [Zionists], who see themselves as carrying the banner of the renewal of Judaism in our times,
think in totally idolatrous terms. After all, the Temple they are longing for embodies all that is linked in our
consciousness to shocking and vicious brutality, such as golden altars, bellowing calves being slaughtered “in the name
of God,” and rivers of blood filling the halls. The fact that they dare to believe that this is Judaism and these are God’s
commandments is no less worrying. After turning Zionism into a movement of heartless thieves with no conscience for
the past 40 years, they now want to impose dangerous nonsense on the spirit of Judaism of our times, of the type that
led to the destruction of our people 2,000 years ago.”

https://www.haaretz.com/opinion/.premium-1.736891

“Christian Zionists, Jews and Freemasons and all the secret societies and intelligence agencies of the World in union
want to re-build a new Solomon’s Temple in Jerusalem, where they can continue sacrifice animals for their sins, and
rule the World from the Throne of Solomon – AntiChrist Kingdom – with the privileges of UN-Human Rights for their
sheeples. It is called the Third Temple (God have removed from the face of the Earth the two first of them, as
prophesised). The Freemasons have been brainwashed to believe that the ‘Jews’ is of tribes of Israel when they in
reality is of the Kenites (Serpent seed), or Edomites after Esau, NOT Jacob.”

http://www.riksavisen.no/freemasons-jews-and-king-salomos-third-temple

This is a video about the Temple Mount, Jerusalem and the rebuilding of Solomon’s Temple. Solomons Temple is
associated with satanic worship, ritual sacrifice and the coming of the ‘anti-christ’.

The Protocols of the Learned Elders of Zion:

“It can be described as the blueprint for the domination of the world by a secret [Jewish] brotherhood. In fact, the title
of the second publication in 1922 was “World Conquest Through World Government”.

It is graphic in its contempt for those who will be its victims, in its profound understanding of the human condition and
mind; and it is equally graphic in detailing the methodology it will use against, and with the complicity of, the world’s
population, in such a way as to go unrecognized by the vast majority of the participants.

The Protocols of the Learned Elders of Zion is a document which should be read by all. No other single document
provides us with such a clear understanding of why the world is gradually moving towards a One World Government,
controlled by an irreproachable [malicious] hidden hand.” (Source) – A summary of what these Protocols involve are in
the photo/image gallery at the end of this article. There are also numerous videos on YouTube explaining what these
protocols involve – you can understand the reason the world is they way it is once you now about these protocols –
again, there is a summary in the quotes section at the end of the article. There are Zioninst Shills/Agents who try to
suggest this document is a hoax – but it is not. And it has Jewish and Freemason terminology in it. Here is a link to the
Protocols – so that you can read it all online:

https://www.biblebelievers.org.au/przion1.htm

Holocaust Hoax
“Well, the idea that the concentration camps were for the express purpose of killing Jews and/or other inmates is
certainly a categorical lie. I don’t deny that there were millions of Jews imprisoned in these camps. But they were
imprisoned because international Jewry had instructed all the Jews in Germany, that if Germany went to war with
England, that every Jew in Germany would sabotage the war effort. That made them Traitors to their nation and that’s
why they were put in camps.

There were NO gas chambers in any concentration camp run by the Germans during World War II, not even in
Auschwitz. The evidence is overwhelming. But the Jewish-owned media has learned that if you tell a lie big enough,
and often enough, the people eventually will believe it. And if anyone has the audacity to really investigate the matter,
looking for the truth, they are called “anti-Semitic.””

– Jonas E. Alexis and Lorraine Day – http://www.veteranstoday.com/2017/07/02/the-holocaust-hoax-is-the-
indispensable-centerpiece-for-the-khazarian-mafia/

(Again, Veterans Today is a Controlled Opposition website, but the excerpt is a good one)

“Aside from the so-called “Holocaust” being mathematically impossible, this monstrous hoax has served as a major
distraction from the real mass murder, torture and genocide perpetrated by the communists. Communism, which is the
creation of a slave labor state, was invented by Jews, and promoted and controlled by Jews. Jewish communism has
mass murdered millions upon millions of innocent human beings; most being Gentiles. Yet, because the media is also
controlled by the Jews [96 percent], very little has been publicized regarding the true horrors of communism.”

http://dawn666blacksun.angelfire.com/Holocaust_Hoax.html

“Within five minutes, any intelligent, open-minded person can be convinced that the Holocaust gassings of World War
II are a profitable hoax.

Fred A. Leuchter is America’s leading specialist on the design and fabrication of execution equipment, including
homicidal gas chambers. In 1988, Leuchter scraped samples from the alleged gas chamber walls in Auschwitz,
Birkenau and Lublin. Cyanide residue would be clearly evident on all these walls if gassings did occur. To his
astonishment, Leuchter found no significant cyanide traces in any one of these rooms.

In 1991, the Polish government repeated these tests to disprove Leuchter’s findings, but they as well found no evidence
of any gassings ever occurring.

The structural integrity of these “gas chambers” is also extremely faulty. These rooms have ordinary doors and windows
which are not hermetically sealed! There are large gaps between the floors and doors. If the Germans had attempted to
gas anyone in these rooms, they would have died themselves, as the gas would have leaked and contaminated the entire
area. Also, no equipment exists to exhaust the air-gas mixture from these buildings. Nothing was made to introduce or
distribute the gas throughout the chambers. There are no provisions to prevent condensation of gas on the walls, floors
or ceilings. No exhaust stacks have ever existed.

Though six million Jews supposedly died in the gas chambers, not one body has ever been autopsied and found to have
died of gas poisoning. We have been shown piles of bodies from World War II, but most of these persons died of typhus
or starvation or Allied bombings and a great many of those were murdered Germans, not Jews. Roughly the equivalent
of ten football fields should be packed full of gassed bodies to present as evidence, yet not one body has ever been
discovered.

The Germans documented everything in meticulous detail from shrubbery to arbors, but no pre-war or wartime plans or
documents exist that detail or even mention any gas chambers for reasons of genocide. All documents ever presented
were drawn up AFTER the war.

Even if we threw away all the evidence and accounted for every so-called gas chamber, it would have taken 68 YEARS
to accomplish gassing six million Jews!

Even The Diary of Anne Frank is a hoax. Portions of the diary were written with a ball point pen. These pens were not
in use at the time Anne Frank lived.

It is not denied concentration camps existed. Tragically, many died of typhus or starvation, as often happens in such
situations. There is, however, no evidence that any gassings occurred for the reasons of genocide.” –
 https://www.biblebelievers.org.au/holohoax.htm

There hasn’t been a man on this planet who has been demonized as much as Herr Hitler. If Hitler wanted to kill Jews,
why oh why throughout all his speeches and manuscripts and his book Mein Kampf did he not mention this? Did he
just forget? No, he didn’t say or write it BECAUSE HE HAD NO INTENTION OF KILLING THE JEWS. No matter
what amount of destruction he had observed done by the Jews to his people; he had enough self-discipline and ethical
code not to take revenge. Being a strong character, he was able to rise above the darkness, the demonic standards of the
judaic mindset and show self-restraint and humility. That is why he created ‘containment work camps’ for the Jews and
certainly NOT death camps. – https://diggerfortruth.wordpress.com/2013/01/16/10-reasons-why-hitler-was-one-of-the-
good-guys/

This is a link to an amazing site that has an extremely definitive and conclusive collection of information and images on
the Holocaust – that will show you what really happened in those work camps: Holocaust Deprogramming Course

Two videos on the Holocaust Hoax  (There are also some images as the end of this article exposing the lies):

Hitler, Germany, National Socialism, The Second World
War –  All Totally Misrepresented

Here are some quotes and excerpts to help you to begin to see that nearly everyone has been misled about Hitler, WW2
and The National Socialist German Workers Party (not the ‘Nazis). Important points to consider: International Jewry
declared war on Germany in 1933 – that’s right 1933! Hitler went into Poland to rescue the German people from
murder and rape. The Zionist controlled Allied Forces declared war on Germany in 1939 – after Hitler had tried hard for
resolutions and peace. The National Socialist German Workers Party and WW2 Germany were not racist and evil.
Hitler had no intention of conquering Europe and the World:

“…24 March 1933, on the front page of the London Daily Express appeared the main headlines: “Judea declares war on
Germany: Jews of the entire world unite”, and followed with:

‘The Israelite people of the entire world declare economic and financial war on Germany. The appearance of the
Swastika as the symbol of the new Germany revives the old war symbol of the Jews. Fourteen million Jews stand as
one body to declare war on Germany. The Jewish wholesale dealer leaves his business, the banker his bank, the
shopkeeper his shop, the beggar his miserable hut in order to combine forces in the holy war against Hitler’s people.'”

http://lovkap.blogspot.co.uk/2011/05/why-hitler-hated-jews.html

Under the War Treaty/Dictate of Versailles Poland was given a “corridor” to the Baltic Sea, along with large areas of
West Prussia that were populated by Germans. This “corridor” completely separated East Prussia from the Reich,
making trade and communication difficult or impossible. During Allied discussions on the peace treaty, Lloyd George,
the English Prime Minister during the First World War, tapped this spot on the map and echoing the words of his
secretary said “This is where (we have planned) the next world war will begin!”

Danzig had 95% German population. German civilians living in Danzig were being murdered. They were peaceful,
most of them farmers. More than 58,000 died at the hands of communists and Polish civilians. Hitler pleaded for the
League of Nations dozens of times to protect them and alow danzigers to vote for their freedom. The world failed these
people in 1939.

Emboldened by the war Guarantee by England, Poland refused to budge or allow plebiscite. No one can tolerate
continued murder of their kin. Hitler finally took matters into his own hands and entered Danzig at their invitation to
rescue his people. Unknown to Hitler this was how International bankers had planned 20 years earlier for WW2 to
happen.

Had England and France not attacked Germany (which they did on 3rd September, 1939) there would have been no
WW2. It was because of England the aggressor that so many died. He did not want war with Britain and France. He was
very surprised when they both declared war on him due to German corridor.

Germany did not invade USA it was USA who declared war on Germany. [The] Attack on russia was more of pre-
emptive strike than invasion.

http://lovkap.blogspot.co.uk/2014/05/lies-about-hitler.html

The Treaty of Versailles had separated the German city of Danzig from Germany and gave it to Poland against the wish
of its citizens. This action was so outrageous that it had been condemned all over the world. A large section of Germany
was sliced through the middle. To go from western Prussia to East Prussia one had to travel in a sealed train through
Polish territory. The citizens of Danzig had voted 99 percent to have their city returned to Germany. Their right of self-
determination had been consistently ignored….

Of all the crimes of World War Two, one never hears about the wholesale massacres that occurred in Poland just before
the war. I have detailed reports in my files documenting the mass slaughter of defenseless Germans in Poland.
Thousands of German men, women and children were massacred in the most horrendous fashion by media-enraged
mobs. The photographs of these massacres are too sickening to look at. Hitler decided to halt the slaughter, and he
rushed to the rescue.

http://www.ihr.org/jhr/v03/v03p441_Degrelle.html

“Third Reich racialism has been deliberately distorted. It was never an anti-“other” racialism. It was a pro-German
racialism. It was concerned with making the German race strong and healthy in every way. Hitler was not interested in
having millions of degenerates. Today one finds rampant alcohol and drug addiction everywhere. Hitler cared that
German families be healthy, and cared that they raise healthy children for the renewal of a healthy nation. German
racialism meant re-discovering the creative values of their own race, re-discovering their culture. It was a striving for
excellence, a noble idea. National Socialist racialism was not against other races, it was for its own race. It aimed at
defending and improving its own race, and wished that all other races would do the same for themselves.

That was demonstrated when the Waffen SS enlarged its ranks to include 60,000 Muslims. The Waffen SS respected
their way of life, their customs, and their religious beliefs. Each Muslim SS battalion had an imam, and each company
had a mullah. It was our common wish that their qualities found their highest expression. That was our racialism. I was
present when each of my Muslim comrades received a New Year’s gift from Hitler. It was a pendant with a small
Koran. Hitler was honoring them with this small symbolic gift, one that honored an important aspect of their lives and
traditions. National Socialist racialism was loyal to the German race and totally respected all other races.”

http://www.ihr.org/jhr/v03/v03p441_Degrelle.html

“The brilliant black historian and sociologist W.E.B. Du Bois visited National Socialist Germany in 1936. He related
that he received more respect from the German academics then from his white colleagues back in America. He was
treated like a human being in Germany, and stated: ‘The National Socialists did not show any trace of racial hatred
toward blacks.’ Society under Nazis was completely integrated.

(Jesse) Owens said, “Hitler didn’t snub me – it was FDR who snubbed me. The president didn’t even send me a
telegram.” On the other hand, Hitler sent Owens a commemorative inscribed cabinet photograph of himself. Jesse
Owens was never invited to the White House nor were honors bestowed upon him by President Franklin D. Roosevelt
(FDR) or his successor Harry S. Truman during their terms though they did meet many other American medalists.

Germany was never racist. Owens was allowed to travel with and stay in the same hotels in Germany as whites, while at
the time blacks in many parts of the United States had to stay in segregated hotels while traveling. After a New York
City ticker-tape parade of Fifth Avenue in his honor, Owens had to ride the freight elevator at the Waldorf-Astoria to
reach the reception honoring him.

The reason why Hitler could not shake hands with Jesse Owens is that Hitler had personally attended the first day of the
track and field competition on 2 August 1936, and did personally congratulate the German athlete Hans Woellke, who
became the first German to win a gold medal in the Olympics since 1896.Throughout the rest of the day, Hitler
continued to receive Olympic champions, German and non German, in his VIP box.”

http://lovkap.blogspot.co.uk/2012/10/germany-or-hitler-were-never-racist.html

“It should also be noted that Hitler never wanted to “conquer the world.” He simply wanted to safeguard Europe and the
greater Western World from all manner of nefarious Jewish influence and, more broadly, safeguard the world-at-large
specifically from, 1) usurious Jewish banking and, 2) Jewish-driven cultural degradation.

As previously stated, the Allied heads-of-State (Roosevelt, Churchill, et al) were puppets of International Jewry; each
sold his soul for power and prestige. Again, as earlier stated, World War II was a war between two competing
ideologies: Nationalism -vs- Jewish Bolshevik Internationalism/globalism — unfortunately International Jewry won.

Was World War II “the good war” as is often claimed? No, it was exactly the opposite. The Allied victory marked the
beginning of the end of Western Civilization.” – http://immigration-globalization.blogspot.co.uk/2011/10/if-hitler-won-
world-war-ii-we-would.html – James L. Miller, PhD

“Usury is the elite Jews most powerful and demonic weapon amongst their whole armament of destructive weapons.
More powerful than their poisons and even their mind control techniques. Because it’s their use of compound interest
that enables them to create a stranglehold on every industry and therefore every level of society. Nobody can escape
usury – everybody is infected by it.

That is why Hitler created his own independent currency as a first move when he came to power. And hey presto – that
is why Germany was able to get back on it’s feet and flourish as all nations should. Hitler recognised the judaic
invention of usury as unlawful, ungodly and unnatural – and as a talmudic curse which has crippled every host nation
the Jews have entered into and ultimately, that which brings about their demise… Hitler freed his people of this curse.”
– https://thegreateststorynevertold.tv/10-reasons-why-hitler-was-one-of-the-good-guys/

A must watch documentary is ‘Adolf Hitler: The Greatest Story Never Told’ by Dennis Wise – watch all parts of it
for free online here: https://thegreateststorynevertold.tv/

Here is a short red pilling video:  (I have to keep finding new videos as YouTube keep deleting WW2 Truth.)

And this one is called Why Hitler Wasn’t Evil:

And here is a link to a website with many excellent articles about the truth about Hitler, Germany and WW2:

https://justice4germans.wordpress.com/

As you can see these videos were censored by (((YouTube))). I recommend this Bitchute Channel for many Hitler and
WW2 Truth videos. The image is linked – the channel will open in a new tab.

https://www.bitchute.com/channel/hitler-and-ww2-truths/

Hitler was not a Jew, a Rothschild or a Zionist Agent
Some Reasons why it is obvious Hitler was not a Zionist agent or a Rothschild:

Hitler showed how quickly a country can be transformed just by getting rid of Jewish Zionists from key positions – by
doing away with Jewish Usury and creating a nationalised independent German currency that was not controllable by
the international Jewish bankers – and by implementing his National Socialist policies, which were for the benefit of
the German people. He created a blueprint for a country’s prosperity. So the Jewish Zionists wanted to destroy him and
they are still, to this day, incessantly spreading lies about him through all the Zionist owned media. Remember,
international Jewry declared war on Germany in 1933, (a global boycott against Germany) after Hitler implemented
these positive changes for his country. And remember that Churchill and Eisenhower were Zionist puppets. If all
countries made the changes that Hitler did the Zionists Satanic New World Order agenda would crumble – the Zionists
would lose all the power they have.

Why would the Rothschilds and the Zionists want to highlight how easy it is to create a happy, unified, empowered and
thriving country? (Hitler eradicated unemployment and transformed a country that was on its knees into a powerhouse)
Why would the Rothschilds and Jewish Zionists want to highlight that it can be easily achieved using procedures and
policies which involved taking power away from the Rothschilds and Jewish Zionists and implementing an independent
debt-free nationalised currency, which frees the country from the influence of Jewish Zionist Bankers? To suggest
Hitler was a Rothschild or a Jewish Zionist Agent is illogical. As well as being ill-informed.

National Socialism and patriotic financially independent countries with leaders who care for, and look after, their people
are the biggest threat to the Rothschilds and the Zionists. Why do you think Gaddafi was taken out as well?

Hitler is the most lied about and vilified man on Earth – all of this is done by the Jewish Zionist owned media, Jewish
Zionist owned education system, Jewish Zionist owned educational curriculums, and the Jewish Zionist owned
Hollywood.

Hitler tried very hard to avert war – and tried hard for peace – over and over he tried to come to a peaceful resolution.
He did not start WW2.

Hitler was loved by his people – you cannot fake that passion he had – you cannot fake the love he had for the German
people. You cannot fool all those people. Just listen to his speeches with the real translations.

To call Hitler a Zionist agent is totally illogical and ill informed.

Who is promoting this idea that Hitler was a Jew, a Rothschild and a Zionist agent? Well it serves the Rothschilds and
Jewish Zionists agenda for people to believe these unsubstantiated claims. The Jewish Zionists promote this idea, it
only serves them.

“So, who wants you to believe this “Hitler was a Jew” or that “Hitler was a Rothschild” rubbish, and why? Whose
agenda does it really serve? The Rothschild’s  and their NWO agenda! Time for the so-called “Truth Movement” to
wake up, to turn your lying “gurus” off, do some research on your own, and figure out who really fought the NWO
agenda, and who had devised the perfect model that would defeat it, if it had been permitted to continue.”

https://justice4germans.wordpress.com/2012/10/13/hitler-was-a-jew-a-rothschild-really

“The rumor that Adolf Hitler was the grandson of a Rothschild seems to have been hatched in the mind of a crypto-
Jewish propagandist working in the United States’ first unified intelligence agency, the Office of Strategic Services
(OSS). Not long after, a former high Nazi official, waiting for his execution, “confessed” to discovering a “Jewish
grandfather” in Hitler’s background. These fabrications have been thoroughly debunked,” 

https://carolynyeager.net/fake-legends-adolf-hitler%E2%80%99s-%E2%80%9Cjewish-grandfather%E2%80%9D

Hitler fought the Zionist New World order Bankers – and warned the world about them. This is a playlist of Hitler
and WW2 Truth videos, if you click on the top left corner of the video you will see the list. Some videos might not play
in your country, as the Zionist owned YouTube censors Hitler and Zionism truth.

Some Concluding Thoughts:
I hope this article has inspired you to research this further. I feel it is of vital importance to understand the Freemasonic
Zionists – especially how they work and their agendas.

A brief overview of some of the Jewish New World Order agendas:

They would like to take away all American citizens guns so they can take over that very significant country. Hence why
there are so many fake hoax shootings to try and bring this to fruition. (Sandy Hook, Virginia Reporter, Mandalay Las
Vegas etc etc)

They would like to also have automated vehicles, taking away millions of jobs and hugely increasing their control over
humanity. They also want more restricted driving in cities, using electronic bollards that they control etc. Again, hence
why we have all this fake hoax terrorist acts of people being run down by cars, vans or lorries. (Nice France, Stockholm
Sweden, Charlottesville etc etc)

They want to bring in 5G towers which will be so incredibly harmful to all of humanity.

They want to increase the use of artificial intelligence in all areas of life – which is going to be hugely damaging to
humanity in so many ways. People must remember that all this technology is being used against humanity.

They want to create these technological ‘Smart’ cities… to control us.

They want genderfluid androgynous type beings ( just like the ‘baphomet’ they worship ) – they want to promote
homosexuality – and move men away from being strong and masculine and women away from being nurturing
feminine homemakers – as this is a threat to them. Eroding family.

Through the use of poisons in vaccines, poisons in food, poisons in water, pharmaceutical drugs, EMFs etc they want to
make us sick, weak and infertile.

They want all nations, races and cultures to merge and interbreed to create one homogeneous race that they can control.
They particularly like to flood Europe with refugees and immigrants, as they want to eradicate the White races –
research ‘The Kalergi Plan’. The Zionists create all the immigration on purpose. They are hugely threatened by patriotic
and nationalistic countries who want independence from the Zionist Bankers. Hence why Gaddafi and Hitler were taken
out and so many lies have been spread about them, even though they were looking after the people in their country –
and to do this they were breaking away from the Freemasonic Zionist Jewish Bankers.

They see the White race as their biggest threat and put a great deal of effort into trying to oppress them… and they wish
to eventually eradicate White people… mainly via forced immigration / miscegenation, control of their nations via
Zionist puppet politicians and their incessant media propaganda. 

They promote Marxism in our schools and universities to subvert our Nations.

They want to keep us in fear and they want more and more control over us… they have so many more tactics and
agendas.

As well as all this, understanding the lies told to us about the Second World War, Hitler and Germany is hugely
important.

And, everybody should learn about the ‘Protocols of the Learned Elders of Zion’ – It explains what these Jewish
Zionists are doing – and it will help you make sense of why the world is like it is. This document will really help you
understand many of their tactics and agendas.  A summary of these protocols is below in the the quote gallery. 

And, of course, they want to build Solomon’s Temple on the Temple Mount in Jerusalem.

As I have mentioned, one of their major tactics is to set up fake terrorist acts and fake events to put fear into the general
population and particularly to bring forth various NWO agendas. A very important tactic of theirs  – which I feel is
imperative for people to understand. Once again, you can see my article on this below the following jpeg photo quotes:

Gallery

Important Note: After the last Website Update the galleries are all playing up. If it is not displaying properly, if
you refresh the page twice it will work just fine. I will endeavour to rectify this issue as soon as possible. Thanks.

Related Articles:

Usury: The Root Cause of all Problems on the Planet
– Debt Slavery – Central Banks, Wars,
Assassinations

(NWO, Solutions – Caesar, Napoleon, Hitler, JFK, Lincoln,

Gaddafi etc) Usury: The action or practice of lending

money at unreasonably … Continue reading
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National Socialism: An Antidote and Solution to the
New World Order and the World’s Problems –
Nature, Family, Altruism, Spirituality, Economics,
NSDAP

(I hope this article inspires people to open their minds and

think for themselves, and to consider National Socialism

as … Continue reading
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Multiculturalism is being used against Humanity –
to help bring about the Zionist New World Order –
Kalergi Plan – White Genocide – Immigration

This is a very sensitive and delicate subject. I will point out that I grew up in London –

which … Continue reading
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False Flags – Fake Shootings – Fake Terrorism –
Psyops, Hoaxes – Zionists, Freemasons, Secret
Societies – Politics

A couple of definitions of False Flag events: “Covert

operations that are designed to deceive in such a way that

… Continue reading
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Adolf Hitler: One of the Good Guys – 12 Things you
were not told about Adolf Hitler and National-
Socialist Germany and 10 Reason why Hitler was one
of the Good Guys

This article is two articles combined – made by other

people. They have excellent information in them. I have

also … Continue reading
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Adolf Hitler and Germany wanted Peace. Extracts
from Adolf Hitler’s Speeches.

(I know some people will find this hard to believe with all

the propaganda, programming and brainwashing that has

occurred, … Continue reading
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7 thoughts on “Zionism – Judaism – Freemasonry – New World Order –
Satanism – Kabbalah – Israel – Palestine – Holocaust – Hitler – Second
World War – National Socialism”

There seems to be an enormous amount of anti Chinese Communist Party propaganda happening right now. Is this just
a deflection of who the real perpetrators are?

Hi wideawakenow

Yes.

Here is an interesting article called ‘Communism Was Created by Jews and Serves Only Their Interests’ – which
includes a section called ‘The Jewish Origins of Mao’s Communist Regime in China’:

http://www.renegadetribune.com/communism-was-created-by-jews-and-serves-only-their-interests/

Is current situation in Israel a proof that these satanic fake jews dont care about israel (outside of using it for their
purposes?) I mean they are killing their own people with this poison!

I have misspoken with “fake” jews. A jew is a jew.

Adolf Hitler said this in Mein Kampf:

“While the Zionists try to make the rest of the World believe that the national consciousness of the Jew finds its
satisfaction in the creation of a Palestinian state, the Jews again slyly dupe the dumb Goyim. It doesn’t even enter
their heads to build up a Jewish state in Palestine for the purpose of living there; all they want is a central
organisation for their international world swindler, endowed with its own sovereign rights and removed from the
intervention of other states: a haven for convicted scoundrels and a university for budding crooks.”

“Palestine is the spiritual center of world Jewry. Though the Jews are numerically insignificant there. Here at the
wailing wall, they gather and mourn the fall of Jerusalem. Their homelessness though is a matter of choice, and
in keeping with their history.

Four thousand years ago, their Hebrew ancestors were already wandering. Out of the land of Two Rivers, they
wandered along the sea to Egypt. Where they ran a lucrative grain business for awhile. When the country
farmers, and other Egyptians rose against the foreign usurers and speculators, they wandered once more and
plundered their way to the promised land [Palestine]. They settled their, mercilessly looting the culturally
superior rightful inhabitants [Palestinians].

Here in the course of centuries, from the Oriental Far Eastern racial admixture, with negroid admixture, the
ultimate mongrelized Jews developed. Foreign from us Europeans, born of totally-different racial elements. They
differ from us body and above all in soul. We probably would never been bothered by them had they stayed in
their Oriental home. But the cosmopolitan empire of Alexander the Great, reaching the Near East across half the
Mediterranean, and especially the boundless world empire of the Romans brought about the evolution of the
trade, and migratory traits of the Jews. Who soon spread across the open Mediterranean area. While some of
them settled in the large urban traffic, and the trade centers of the Mediterranean. Others wandered relentlessly
across Spain, France, Southern Germany, and England. Everywhere, they made themselves unwelcome. In Spain
and France the people rose openly against them in the 13th and 14th centuries, and wandered on, mainly to
Germany. From there they followed the path of the Aryan culture. Creative Germans colonizing the East till they
finally found a gigantic new untapped reservoir in the polish and Russian sections of Eastern Europe. The 19th
century with it’s muddled ideas about human equality and freedom, gave the Jews a great lift. From Eastern
Europe they spread across the entire continent during the 19th and 20th centuries, and then across the world.

Parallel to these Jewish wanderings throughout the world is the migration of a similar restless animal, the rat.
Rats have been parasites on mankind from the very beginning. Their home is Asia, from which they migrated in
gigantic hordes over Russia and the Balkans into Europe. By the middle of the 18th century, they’d already
spread over all of Europe. Toward the end of the 19th century, with growing shipping traffic, they took
possession of America as well, and eventually Africa and the Far East. Wherever rats turn up, they carry
destruction to the land by destroying mankind’s goods, and nourishment, and spreading diseases and plagues.
Such as cholera, dysentery, leprosy, and typhoid fever. They are cunning, cowardly, cruel, and usually appear in
massive hordes. They represent the elements of sneakiness and subterranean destruction among animals. Just as
the Jews do among mankind.” -The Eternal Jew 1940

“Wherever the body of a nation shows a wound, they anchor themselves and feed on the decaying organism. They
make business out of the sickness of the nations, and therefore endeavor to deepen and prolong all conditions of
sickness. That’s how it is in Poland and was in Germany. The Jews have been this way throughout their entire history.”
-The Eternal Jew 1940
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